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Isabel Nixon Klein is a student filmmaker and
performer in Olympia, WA. Starting out in a small
community theater out in Morton, WA where the
rain leaked onto the stage is where Isabel got her
love for the performing and visual arts. Isabel has
now acted in over 50 live theater productions and
been on the cast or crew of a dozen community
film productions. Some of the recent short films
Isabel was in include: Blocked (2021), Blind Duet
(2022), DRIPS (2023) and SPEC (2024). Isabel’s
experience is not limited to being in front of the
camera or in the spotlight, she has worn many
hats and participated in productions as a director,
producer, writer, editor, and art director.  Isabel
got her start in filmmaking at a young age,
messing around with a camcorder to try and find
out how the magic happens and started
consistently making short films when her team
won the Rainier Independent Film Festival’s
student competition for two years in 2017 and 2019
respectivly. Her most recent short film The Perfect
Night (2024), in collaboration with OlyFilm and
TCMedia, featured a cast and crew of 35+ local
filmmakers and actors and premiered at the
Capitol Theater in downtown Olympia. 


